
Notice of Filing 
 

 

Research and Development Engineer (University of California, Riverside; Riverside, CA): Responsible for 
developing the Department Safety program and for ensuring full implementation of the program. Provide training, 
instruction and oversee faculty, researchers, staff, and students in the safe operation of lab facilities and 
equipment. Responsible for ensuring the Security functions comply with all campus policies and guidelines as 
well as directing activities in event of fires, explosions, and other emergencies in the facilities. Responsible for 
security and access of facilities. Provide periodic updates on location records checks on lab equipment. Prepare 
tools, parts and equipment for required labs for faculty, TAs and students. Check out/in materials to/from faculty, 
TAs, Researchers and students. Function as project manager for complex engineering assignments. Provide 
engineering information and advice to Principal Investigators and/or other faculty and research personnel with 
administrative responsibility for the research program or teaching facility. Provide cost analysis using time 
schedules and budgetary considerations. Supervise in-house fabrication of prototypes. Analyze and resolve work 
problems and assist staff in solving work problems. Prepare bid packages for outside vendors. Serve on 
professional committees in field of specialization. Ensure work is completed in a timely and efficient manner. 
Provide direction and guidance to lower level Development Engineers. Represent the unit and/or Principal 
Investigator to whom they are responsible at meetings and conferences in matters related to engineering design 
considerations and financial requirements. Schedule and assign projects to staff. Plan, organize, and perform the 
work of a professional engineering team engaged in a specialized engineering field of a training and/or research 
program. 
 
Salary: $103,587.00 per year 
 
Send resume to: Attn: Nicole Kramer, University of California, Riverside, 900 University Avenue, Riverside, CA 
92521.  
 
Date posted: May 16th 2022 _________ 
 
Date removed: ______________________ 
 
Location: ______________________ 
 
Office Address: 900 University Avenue, Riverside, CA, 92521. 
 
______________________________ 
Name: Nicole Kramer 
    
______________________________ 
Title: Financial and Administrative Officer

 
This notice is provided in anticipation of the filing of an application for permanent alien labor certification.  Any person 
may provide documentary evidence bearing on the application to the U.S. Department of Labor, Employment and 
Training Administration, Office of Foreign Labor Certification, 200 Constitution Avenue NW, Room N-5311, 
Washington, DC 20210. 


